
Assistant Professor of Space Science in Faculty of Science and Engineering, Department of 
Earth and Space Science and Engineering, Affiliation/Union: YUFA Position Start Date: 
July 1, 2009 

York University offers a world-class, modern, interdisciplinary academic experience in Toronto, 
Canada’s most multicultural city. York is at the centre of innovation, with a thriving community 
of almost 60,000 faculty, staff and students who challenge the ordinary and deliver the 
unexpected. 
 
The Faculty of Science and Engineering offers a progressive, dynamic environment, and has 
over 155 faculty members. It has engaged in teaching and research activities for over 40 years. 
Further information about the Faculty can be found at: www.science.yorku.ca 

Applications are invited for a tenure-stream appointment at the Assistant Professor level in the 
field of Space Science to start July 1, 2009. All positions at York University are subject to 
budgetary approval. At York, Space Science involves the study of the atmosphere from Space, 
which includes design and use of satellite instrumentation, analysis of satellite data, and related 
areas. The candidate’s expertise should enhance the existing activities in Space Science at York 
University (see www.yorku.ca/esse/ for a more complete list) carried out within the Department. 
Candidates must have a strong commitment to research and teaching, and have a PhD in 
Atmospheric Science or a related field. The successful candidate will be expected to have or 
develop strong, externally funded research programs, and contribute to teaching at the 
undergraduate and graduate levels. The successful candidate must be suitable for prompt 
appointment to the Faculty of Graduate Studies.  

York University is an Affirmative Action Employer. The Affirmative Action Program can be 
found on York's website at www.yorku.ca/acadjobs or a copy can be obtained by calling the 
affirmative action office at 416-736-5713. All qualified candidates are encouraged to apply; 
however, Canadian citizens and Permanent Residents will be given priority.  

Applicants should forward (as hard copy, only) a curriculum vitae, an outline of their research 
plans and single copies of three publications, and arrange for references from three referees to be 
sent by December 1, 2008, to:  
 
Chair, Search Committee, Department of Earth and Space Science and Engineering, Room 102 
Petrie Science and Engineering Building  
York University  
4700 Keele Street, Toronto, Ontario M3J 1P3  

  

 
 


